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Our Brands (Food Ingredient Supplies) -

Faesol supplies ingredients and blends to help users make 
healthier sweetened products. We carry the iLite© brand 
of ingredients to replace nutritive sweeteners in the 
“Healthier Sweet” space. We also distribute high intensity 
sweeteners, such as the naturally occurring stevia, and 
sucralose. 

Our Services (Customized Powder Blends) –

Faesol’s dry powder blending capabilities coupled with our 
managed packed services is one of the key strengths to 
customized packaging solutions for our customers. 

We are able to provide pilot; low / steady state volume 
production runs of Made-in-Singapore products for our 
clients. The quality standards we achieved are, GMP, 
HACCP, ISO22000/2005, Halal, and MasterChem Lab 
Quality certifications. Other services include the sourcing 
of ingredients, accredited laboratory testing and 
certification. 

Our Solutions (Customized Food Solutions) –

To fulfil the brand promise, Faesol performs the role of 
customization in food solutions for our partners in the 
area of formulation work. Our speciality revolves around 
the creation of “Healthier Sweet Products”, which could be 
in the space of Fast Moving Consumer Goods (FMCGs), 
and sweetener blends for food services and food 
manufacturing application. The core competencies include 
shelf life testing, lab scale testing, and scale up trails at the 
customer’s facilities. 
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